
$1,750 - 608 Plano Drive, College Station
MLS® #25010431 

$1,750
3 Bedroom, 2.00 Bathroom, 1,184 sqft
Residential Lease on 0.13 Acres

Westfield, College Station, TX

Freshly updated 3-bedroom, 2-bath home in
south College Station! This well-maintained
property offers an open-concept layout with a
spacious L-shaped kitchen featuring ample
countertop and cabinet space. The large
primary suite includes oversized windows that
fill the room with natural light. Each bedroom
offers generous closet space. The home will
be freshly painted prior to move-in, with new
luxury vinyl plank flooring replacing much of
the existing carpet. Enjoy a fenced backyard
with a small patio and an attached single-car
garage. Conveniently located near Edelweiss
Park, minutes from multiple HEBs, and only 10
minutes to TAMU! It is tucked between
Wellborn Road and Highway 6 for easy access
around town. Available November 7, 2025.
Pets are allowed with restrictions and fees.
Tenant pays all utilities and is responsible for
lawn care.

Built in 2002

Essential Information

MLS® # 25010431

Price $1,750

Bedrooms 3

Bathrooms 2.00

Full Baths 2

Square Footage 1,184

Acres 0.13

Year Built 2002



Type Residential Lease

Sub-Type Single Family Residence

Style Traditional

Status Active

Community Information

Address 608 Plano Drive

Area C12

Subdivision Westfield

City College Station

County Brazos

State TX

Zip Code 77845

Amenities

Parking Attached, Garage

# of Garages 1

Interior

Appliances Gas Water Heater, Water Heater

Heating Central, Gas

Cooling Central Air, Ceiling Fan(s), Electric

# of Stories 1

Stories One

Exterior

Roof Composition

Construction Brick

Foundation Slab

School Information

District College Station

Additional Information

Days on Market 1

Listing Details

Listing Agent Gregory Schwartz

Listing Office Keller Williams Realty Brazos Valley office

The information being provided is for consumers' personal, non-commercial use and may not be used for any purpose



other than to identify prospective properties consumers may be interested in purchasing. The data is deemed reliable
but is not guaranteed accurate by the MLS. Listing information is provided by Bryan-College Station Regional MLS. 


